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  Emphasis of matter Management’s reply 
 

3(a) As Stated in Note no. 15.4 of the 
financial statements, Jaiprakash  
Associates Limited (JAL) had pledged 
30% of shares of the Company  and 
also agreed and signed a Non-
Disposal Undertaking (NDU) for the 
remaining 44% shares in favour of 
Yes Bank Ltd. (YBL) as a collateral 
security against the loan facility of 
Rs.465 crore availed by Jaypee 
Cement Corporation Ltd. (JCCL), a 
wholly-own subsidiary of JAL. YBL 
assigned the same in the favour of 
Assets Care and Reconstruction 
Enterprises Limited (ACRE).  The 
ACRE informed about the transfer of  
entire  pledged /NDU shares of the 
Company in its name. However, JAL 
continues to show the investment in 
its books of accounts as the 
shareholders agreement with Steel 
Authority of India (SAIL), the JV 
partner in the Company, provides 
that a purported transfer not in 
accordance with the terms of 
Shareholders Agreement shall be 
null and void. The Company has 
therefore maintained status quo 
ante of the shareholding in its Books 
of Accounts though depository has 
transferred the shares in the name 
of ACRE.  

The position has been explained in 
Note 15.4 to the financial 
statements.  
 
YBL sanctioned Rupee Term Loan 
(RTL) of Rs.465 crore to JCCL, a 
wholly owned subsidiary of 
Jaiprakash Associates Ltd. against 
prime security of 74% stake sale in 
BJCL (definitive agreement with 
Orient Cement Ltd) by way of 30% 
pledge and 44% NDU. 
 
YBL subsequently assigned the said 
RTL of Rs.465 crore to ACRE 
alongwith the prime security. ACRE 
has transferred 30% + 44 % NDU in 
its name. The Company has 
disputed the assignment and 
transfer of shares as null & void  
ab-initio.  

3(b) As Stated in Note no. 37 of the 
financial statements, no provision 
has been considered necessary by 
the management against Entry Tax 
amounting to Rs. 3408.62 lakhs 
(including interest) as demanded by 
the Commercial Tax Department.  

The reason for not making provision 
for Entry Tax of Rs. 34.09 crore has 
been explained in Note 37 to the 
Financial Statements. 
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